

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 877-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

TOWN OF APPLE VALLEY
ATTN: LA VONDA PEARSON
14955 DALE EVANS PARKWAY
APPLE VALLEY, CA 92307-3061

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
JEB
Page 1

INVOICE SUMMARY

For Professional Services Rendered Through July 31, 2014:

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

Current Fees:	\$	45,694.60
Current Reimbursable Costs:		1,260.05
		<hr/>
Total Current Billings For This Matter:	\$	46,954.65
		<hr/> <hr/>

INVOICE IS DUE AND PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
06/10/14	BEGIN RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] RANCHOS ASSOCIATE 2: CAMBRIA SMITH	2.30
06/10/14	CREATE [REDACTED] DRAFT CLERK: MARC TRAN	7.00
06/11/14	DRAFT EMAIL TO ATTY BROWN RE [REDACTED]; DRAFT EMAIL TO MR. ROBINSON RE SAME; RESEARCH RE [REDACTED]; DRAFT MEMO RE SAME; PREPARE FILE ON [REDACTED]; GATHER [REDACTED]; DRAFT EMAIL TO MR. CRON RE [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE 2: THOMAS RICE	4.20
06/11/14	CONTINUE RESEARCH RE [REDACTED]; DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO ATTY ACKERMAN RE SAME; EDIT SAME; CORRESP W/ ATTY ACKERMAN RE SAME ASSOCIATE 2: CAMBRIA SMITH	3.30
06/11/14	DOWNLOAD D [REDACTED]; EMAILS RE SAME; REVIEW [REDACTED]; EMAIL RE SAME PARALEGAL: TAMMY L. INGRAM	0.50
06/12/14	PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND SEND VARIOUS INFORMATIONAL E-MAILS TO TOWN MANAGER; COMPOSE AND SEND E-MAIL TO TOWN MANGER'S RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	1.20
06/12/14	REVIEW [REDACTED]; REVISE [REDACTED]; DRAFT EMAIL TO ATTY BROWN RE SAME; RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE 2: THOMAS RICE	2.30

Indian Wells
(760) 588-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(809) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
06/15/14	TRAVEL TOR EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS; PREPARATION RELATED TO SAME; EXCHANGE EMAIL [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	6.60
06/16/14	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS; MULTIPLE T/CONFS AND EMAILS RELATED TO SAME PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	10.00
06/17/14	REVIEW E-MAILS FROM [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND SEND VARIOUS E-MAILS RE [REDACTED]; COORDINATE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	4.00
06/17/14	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN EVIDENTIARY HEARINGS; RETURN TRAVEL FROM SAME PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	8.80
06/18/14	CONTINUE WORK [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND SEND NUMEROUS EMAILS AND DOCUMENTS RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	4.70
06/18/14	INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED] H. MACVEY	0.20
06/18/14	WORK ON [REDACTED]; DRAFT EMAIL TO ATTY VANCANAGAN RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	0.80
06/19/14	INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED] T PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.10
06/24/14	REVIEW [REDACTED]; DISCUSS SAME AND [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE 2: THOMAS RICE	0.40
06/25/14	INTRA O/CONF W/ MR. BROWN RE [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.80

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
06/25/14	REVIEW [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND EXCHANGE VARIOUS E-MAILS RE [REDACTED]; FORWARD [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND SEND AND REVIEW NUMEROUS E-MAILS RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	4.20
06/26/14	EXCHANGE EMAIL RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	0.40
06/27/14	RESEARCH ASSISTANCE TO ATTY BROWN RE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: NANCY G. STUBBS	0.30
06/30/14	REVIEW E-MAIL [REDACTED]; FORWARD E-MAIL TO ATTY GARCIA RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	0.80
06/30/14	BEGIN REVIEW OF [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: ANDREW MAIORANO	1.60
07/01/14	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EXCHANGES OF E-MAILS RE [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ TOWN MANAGER AND TOWN CLERK RE [REDACTED]; SUGGEST REVISIONS; REVIEW RELATED MATTERS PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	1.30
07/01/14	REVIEW OF [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	0.70
07/01/14	CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: ANDREW MAIORANO	1.90
07/07/14	REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED]; RESEARCH REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED]; T/CONF [REDACTED]; EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	2.20

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 5

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/08/14	CONTINUE REVIEW OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: ANDREW MAIORANO	0.40
07/09/14	CONTINUE PREPARING [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND SEND E-MAILS TO TOWN MANAGER AND STAFF; REVIEW VOICE-MAIL MESSAGE FROM MS. MARTIN; T/CONF W/ MS. MARTIN RE [REDACTED]; CONF CALL W/ MESSRS ROBINSON, CRON AND PUCKETT RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	3.20
07/09/14	RESEARCH RE [REDACTED]; DRAFT MEMO RE SAME CLERK: ALEXANDRA ANDREEN	5.10
07/09/14	DRAFT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MATTHEW COLLINS	0.70
07/10/14	REVIEW OF [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	1.10
07/10/14	DRAFT AND FINALIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MATTHEW COLLINS	2.40
07/11/14	PREPARATION FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	2.00
07/11/14	CONTINUE WORK ON [REDACTED]S; SEND NUMEROUS E-MAILS TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTY BROGAN RE [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; WORK ON [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND SEND E-MAIL RE [REDACTED]; FOLLOW- UP ON [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	3.90
07/11/14	INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ COUNSEL FOR [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.80

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 6

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/11/14	CONFS W/ ATTY BROWN RE [REDACTED] ION; CONF W/ MR. OLDS RE SAME PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	0.70
07/11/14	REVIEW OF [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	0.80
07/13/14	PREPARE FOR [REDACTED]; TRAVEL [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	7.80
07/14/14	ATTEND [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; TRAVEL FROM [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	14.90
07/14/14	PREPARING [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	0.70
07/14/14	RESEARCH, REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; OUTLINE AND DEVELOP [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	6.70
07/14/14	REVISE AND DRAFT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MATTHEW COLLINS	1.20
07/15/14	FOLLOW-UP ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; BEGIN PREPARATION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; BEGIN PREPARATION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND FOLLOW-UP [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND SEND NUMEROUS E-MAILS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; BEGIN PREPARATION OF [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ ATTY GARCIA RE [REDACTED]; REVIEW [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	3.20

Indian Wells
(760) 588-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 7

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/15/14	INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED]; ANALYZE [REDACTED] D PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.80
07/15/14	CONF W/ ATTY BROWN RE [REDACTED]; PROVIDING DRAFT [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW AND REVISIONS TO [REDACTED] Y PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	1.60
07/15/14	CONTINUE WORKING ON [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	2.60
07/15/14	REVISE AND FINALIZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MATTHEW COLLINS	0.40
07/15/14	PREPARE [REDACTED] AND ATTY GARCIA PARALEGAL: KRYSTEN STEELE	0.30
07/15/14	RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: SARAH C. FOLEY	1.10
07/15/14	BEGIN WORK WITH LAW CLERK MR. COLLINS ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; CORRESPOND WITH ATTYS BROWN, DALLARDA, AND GARCIA RE SAME ASSOCIATE 2: THOMAS RICE	0.40
07/15/14	RESEARCH AND EXAMINE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: KRYSTEN STEELE	0.70

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 999-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0800

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 8

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/16/14	FINALIZE [REDACTED] RE [REDACTED]; CONF W/ ATTYS ACKERMAN AND KNOX RE [REDACTED]; CONF CALL W/ TOWN MANAGER AND MESSRS. CRON AND PUCKETT; REVIEW [REDACTED]; BEGIN LEGAL RESEARCH; COMPOSE AND SEND E-MAILS; FOLLOW-UP ON [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; REVIEW E-MAIL AND DRAFT [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; COMPOSE AND SEND E-MAIL TO TOWN MANAGER RE [REDACTED]; EXCHANGE E-MAILS RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ TOWN CLERK'S OFFICE RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: JOHN E. BROWN	3.30
07/16/14	INTRA O/CONFERENCES RE [REDACTED]; T/CONF W/ CLIENT RE SAME; PREPARE EMAIL MEMO RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ACVEY	1.70
07/16/14	RESEARCH [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	1.70
07/16/14	FURTHER RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: SARAH C. FOLEY	0.70
07/16/14	REVIEW AND REVISE [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; RESEARCH RE [REDACTED]; CORRESPOND WITH LAW CLERK MR. COLLINS RE SAME ASSOCIATE 2: THOMAS RICE	1.40
07/16/14	CORRESP W/ ATTY BROWN, MR. PUCKETT RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE 2: CAMBRIA SMITH	0.10
07/16/14	T/CONF W/ ATTYS JOHN BROWN, PAETER GARCIA, PIERO DALLARDA, AND JASON ACKERMAN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CLERK: MATTHEW COLLINS	0.70
07/16/14	T/CONF W/ TOWN STAFF AND ATTY BROWN RE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	0.60

Indian Wells
(760) 588-2611

Irvine
(949) 263-2600

Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100

Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 688-1450 | Fax: (951) 688-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000

San Diego
(619) 525-1300

Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300

Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
07/16/14	RESEARCH, REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED]; EXAMINE [REDACTED]; WORK ON [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	5.60
07/16/14	T/CONF W/ ATTYS BROWN AND ACKERMAN RE [REDACTED]; BEGIN RESEARCH RE [REDACTED] ASSOCIATE: PARISSH A. KNOX	1.30
07/17/14	INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED] PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.40
07/17/14	RESEARCH, REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED]; EXAMINE [REDACTED]; WORK ON [REDACTED] PARTNER: JASON M. ACKERMAN	7.60
07/17/14	EMAILS W/ ATTY ACKERMAN RE [REDACTED]; EDIT [REDACTED]; CREATE [REDACTED] PARALEGAL: TAMMY L. INGRAM	2.90
07/18/14	INTRA O/CONF RE [REDACTED] S PARTNER: KENDALL H. MACVEY	0.20
07/18/14	CONF W/ ATTY QUASS RE [REDACTED]; REVIEW OF [REDACTED] PARTNER: PIERO C. DALLARDA	1.60
07/18/14	FURTHER EDITS TO [REDACTED]; EMAILS W/ ATTY ACKERMAN RE SAME PARALEGAL: TAMMY L. INGRAM	0.60

Summary of Fees:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hr</u>	<u>Amount</u>
JOHN E. BROWN	PARTNER	54.50	304.63	16,602.50
KENDALL H. MACVEY	PARTNER	5.00	304.90	1,524.50
PIERO C. DALLARDA	PARTNER	9.50	306.00	2,907.00
JASON M. ACKERMAN	PARTNER	51.30	303.41	15,564.80
SARAH C. FOLEY	ASSOCIATE	1.80	268.00	482.40
PARISSH A. KNOX	ASSOCIATE	1.30	268.00	348.40
ANDREW MAIORANO	ASSOCIATE	3.90	266.36	1,038.80
THOMAS RICE	ASSOCIATE 2	8.70	248.83	2,164.80
CAMBRIA SMITH	ASSOCIATE 2	5.70	248.07	1,414.00
MARC TRAN	CLERK	7.00	158.00	1,106.00
ALEXANDRA ANDREEN	CLERK	5.10	161.00	821.10
MATTHEW COLLINS	CLERK	5.40	161.00	869.40
NANCY G. STUBBS	PARALEGAL	0.30	158.00	47.40

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2811
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 10

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hr</u>	<u>Amount</u>
KRYSTEN STEELE	PARALEGAL	1.00	161.00	161.00
TAMMY L. INGRAM	PARALEGAL	4.00	160.63	642.50

Total Hours: 164.50

Total Fees for Professional Services \$ 45,694.60

Reimbursable Costs:

LOCAL TRAVEL

06/06/14	SOUTHWEST AIRLINE - SAN FRANCISCO - 06/15/2014 - 06/20/2014 JASON ACKERMAN, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARING AT CPUC OFFICE(JMA)	507.50
06/17/14	SOUTHWEST AIRLINE - SAN FRANCISCO - 06/15/2014 - 06/20/2014 JASON ACKERMAN, ATTEND EVIDENTIARY HEARING AT CPUC OFFICE - FLIGHT CHANGE DIFFERENCE (JMA)	(10.00)
07/13/14	PARKING, [REDACTED] PARKING AT ONTARIO, AIRPORT TO ATTEND [REDACTED] 07/13/2014, JOHN BROWN	20.50
07/13/14	HOTEL - [REDACTED] [REDACTED], 07/13/2014, JOHN BROWN	155.01
07/14/14	PARKING, [REDACTED] ATTEND [REDACTED] [REDACTED], 07/14/2014, JOHN BROWN	5.50
07/14/14	AIRLINE CHANGE TICKET FEE, [REDACTED] ATTEND [REDACTED], 07/14/2014, JOHN BROWN	50.00
07/14/14	CAR RENTAL, [REDACTED] T ALL [REDACTED] JOHN BROWN	177.64
07/14/14	DELTA AIR, [REDACTED] 07/13/2014 TO 07/14/2014 JOHN BROWN ATTEND [REDACTED] (JEB)	235.50
	SUBTOTAL:	1,141.65

SHIPPING

07/21/14	SHIPPING	12.15
	SUBTOTAL:	12.15
07/31/14	PRINT COST	106.25

Indian Wells
(760) 568-2611
Irvine
(949) 263-2600
Los Angeles
(213) 617-8100
Ontario
(909) 989-8584



BEST BEST & KRIEGER
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

3390 University Avenue, 5th Floor, P.O. Box 1028, Riverside, CA 92502
Phone: (951) 686-1450 | Fax: (951) 686-3083 | www.bbklaw.com
Tax ID # 95-2157337

Sacramento
(916) 325-4000
San Diego
(619) 525-1300
Walnut Creek
(925) 977-3300
Washington DC
(202) 785-0600

Our Matter # 28314.0201A
Re: APPLE VALLEY RANCHOS WATER COMPANY

August 7, 2014
Invoice 730912
Page 11

Total Reimbursable Costs	\$ 1,260.05
Total Current Billings For This Matter:	\$ 46,954.65